
Line Item Description
4.10.1 De-greaser Cleaner – Quart-size spray 

bottle 
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid  $5.20
Brand and Product Name: Spartan RTU Orange   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 1 quart (4 
gallons/512 oz)

$33.19
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Pro-Cleaning/degreaser 
RL:3005-12                                                                                     
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  12-32oz spray 
bottle/case (3 Gallons/12 Quarts)

No Bid $24.28
Brand and Product Name: Spartan The Degreaser Empty Spray
Bottles #926600                                                                           
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz bottle/case (3 
Gallons/12 Quarts)

4.10.2 De-greaser Cleaner – Refill - Gallon 
 4 bottles per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.25
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Tough On Grease   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 - 1 Gallon/case

$39.95
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Tough on Grease SP2034    
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 gallons/case

No Bid  $78.90
Brand and Product Name: Spartan The Degreaser #4734   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-2L bottle/case

4.10.3 All-Purpose Cleaner – Quart-size Spray 
Bottle - Ready-to-Use, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.98
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Xcelente      
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  12 quarts/case 
(3gallon/384  oz)

$28.15
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Fast and Easy SP3260   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz spray 
bottle/case (3 Gallons/12 Quarts)

No Bid $27.95
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Fast & Easy #RTUF&A 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz bottles/case (3 
Gallons/12 Quarts)

4.10.4 All-Purpose Cleaner – Gallon Refill - 
Ready-to-Use, No Dilution Required
4/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.82
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Xcelente  
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4-1 Gallon/Case

$34.50
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Fast and Easy SP3260   
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4-1 Gallon/Case

No Bid $34.35
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Fast & Easy #3262   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottles/case

4.10.5 All-Purpose Cleaner – surfactant using 
hydrogen peroxide formulated to quickly 
remove everyday soil including greasy 
residues – effectively cleans multiple 
surfaces – 1 Gallon size
4 case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.95
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Clean and Peroxy SP0035   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 gallons/case

No Bid $70.35
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Clean by Peroxy #0035   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottles/case

4.10.6 Vinegar, white, minimum 5% acidity – 1 
Gallon size
4/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Alternative No Bid $11.08
Brand and Product Name: Pastorelli White Distilled Vinegar 
#1256VIN                                                                                  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottles/case

4.10.6 - Alternative 1 Arocep Cleaning Vinegar 4/1gl Cost- $12.95                                                               
Arocep-Brands Vary with Availability                                  
Packaging - 4 gallons/case

4.10.7 Disinfectant Cleaner – Spray Bottle - 
Quart-size - Ready-to-Use, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.91
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CDC 10
 Packaging (size of container, # per case)12 Quarts/Case  (3 
gallon/384 oz)

$33.73
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CDC-10 SP3210                      
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz spray 
bottle/case (3 Gallons/12 Quarts)

No Bid $37.31
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CDC-10 #3210                        
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz Bottles/case

4.10.8 Disinfectant Cleaner – Gallon Refill - 
Ready-to-Use, No Dilution Required
4/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.49
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CDC 10
 Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4-1 Gallon/Case

$51.05
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CDC-10 SP3220                      
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4-1 Gallon/case

No Bid $51.36
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CDC-10 #322004                    
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz Bottles/case

4.10.9 Pine Sol, Ready-to-Use General purpose 
cleaner/disinfectant, No Dilution Required 
– Pine and Lemon Scent
144-oz. plastic bottle
3/case

No Bid No Bid See Alternative 1 No Bid $39.55
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Pine Disinfect Cleaner 
RL2055                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-1Gallon/case

No Bid $40.43
Brand and Product Name: Pine Sol Lemon #CLOX60607             
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 80oz bottles-3 
bottles/case

4.10.9 - Alternative 1 Pine Sol. Ready-to-use General-purpose 
cleaner/disinfectant, No dilution required - 
Pine and Lemon Scent - *80 OZ Bottle*

Cost- $59.98  
Pine-Sol #CLO60606CT     
Packaging - 3-80oz/case

4.10.10 Powdered Cleanser, cleans and deodorizes, 
can be used on several surfaces without 
scratching – e.g., porcelain, stainless steel, 
fiberglass, marble, glazed ceramic tile, etc. 
– Pine scent
21-oz. can - 24/case

No Bid No Bid $57.85
Brand and Product Name: Comet #PGC32987CT   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 24 - 21oz/Case

No Bid $40.29
Brand and Product Name: P&G Comet powder PG32987 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 24-21oz can/case

No Bid $19.18
Brand and Product Name: Old Product Company Kitchen 
Klenzer #723190153K                                                       Packaging
(size of container, # per case) 24-21oz Cans/Case

4.10.11 Toilet Bowl Cleaner- Acid, Ready-to-Use 
Squeeze Quart Bottle, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.77
Brand and Product Name: Bowl Nectar    
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12 Quarts/Case (3 
gallon/384 oz)

$24.13
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Acid clinging bowl cleaner 
RL2010-12                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz/case(3 
Gallons/12 Quarts)

No Bid $16.77
Brand and Product Name: Centraz Bovex L.A. Acid Bowl 
Cleaner #1B12IS121                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz bottles-12 
bottles/case

4.10.12 Toilet Bowl Cleaner- Non-Acid, Ready-to-
Use Squeeze Quart Bottle, No Dilution 
Required
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.84
Brand and Product Name: NCL Bathroom Plus  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12 Quarts/Case (3 
Gallons)

$25.80
Brand and Product Name: Spartan NABC Bowl Cleaner SP7116 
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  12-32oz/case

No Bid $20.63
Brand and Product Name: Centraz Galaxy II non-acid Bowl 
Cleaner #IB10IS121                                                     
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz bottles-12 
bottles/case

4.10.13 Bathroom Cleaner – Spray Bottle - Quart-
size - Ready-to-Use, No Dilution Required 
– Removes touch soap scum and hard 
water stains, non-abrasive, no rinsing or 
scrubbing, EPA registered, hospital grade 
disinfectant
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.35
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Peroxy II Restroom Cleaner 
SP3535                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  12-32oz/case

No Bid $60.22
Brand and Product Name: Comet Disinfectant 
#30314/84836923                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz bottles-8 
bottles/case

4.10.14 Glass Cleaner – trigger spray bottle, quart-
size, ready-to-use, no dilution required, 
ammonia in formula, cuts through dirt, 
grease, leaves no streaks
12 per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.35
Brand and Product Name: Royalab RTU Ammoniated Glass 
Cleaner RL3000-12                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz/case

No Bid $20.03
Brand and Product Name: Centraz Kleer Glass Cleaner 
#1J75IS121                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz bottles-12 
bottles/case

4.10.15 Glass Cleaner – Ready-to-Use CRT and 
Plexiglass cleaner – no ammonia, no 
solvent with anti-static component – for 
use on computer screens, plastic, stainless 
steel and all glass surfaces – quart bottle 
with trigger spray
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.07
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Sign Off    
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 12 Quarts/case (3 
Gallons)

$27.98
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Sign Off CRT and Plexiglass 
cleaner SP3290                                                      
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz/case

No Bid $30.96
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Sign-Off #329003  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz bottles-12 
bottles/case

4.10.16 Glass Cleaner – Gallon Refill ready-to-use, 
no dilution required, ammonia in formula, 
cuts through dirt, grease, leaves no streaks
4 /per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.19
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Glass Cleaner 3030 SP3030 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 gallons/case

No Bid $29.06
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Glass Cleaner #303004 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 128oz bottles- 4 
bottles/case
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4.10.17 Trigger spray bottle, plastic, quart (32-oz.)
12/case

No Bid No Bid $9.48
Brand and Product NameBoardwalk #5032WG-12
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12/case

No Bid $1.41
Brand and Product Name: Royalab 32 oz bottle RL-Royalbttl32 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Sold individual, 32 oz.

No Bid $0.77
Brand and Product Name: Janico Spray Bottle #bottle32  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz Bottle Sold 
Individually

4.10.18 Trigger spray for 32-oz. bottle with 9.88” 
tube, general purpose
24 per case

No Bid No Bid $21.36
Brand and Product Name: Impact #4902-24 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 24/case

No Bid $1.89
Brand and Product Name: Royalab 10" BL/Wh trigger sprayer 
RL-TRIG-Spray                                                    
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Sold individual

No Bid $0.77
Brand and Product Name: Janico Trigger Sprayer 
#32TRIGGER 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 32oz Bottle with 9" 
tube Sold Individually

4.10.19 Stainless Steel Cleaner - Oil Based– 16 oz. 
aerosol can stainless steel and metal polish 
– heavy-duty cleaning agents and 
surfactants that deep-cleans stainless steel 
surfaces, removes smudges & etc. and 
polishes/restores luster with minimum 
effort
12/case

No Bid No Bid $41.98
Brand and Product Name: Chase #433-4111  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-16oz/case

No Bid $61.85
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Superior hi shine oil base ss 
clnr SP6290                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-15oz can/case

No Bid $47.74
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Stainless Steel Polish 
Oil Based #K01010
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-15OZ cans/case

4.10.20 Stainless Steel Cleaner – Water Based – 
17.5 oz. aerosol can stainless steel and 
metal polish – deep cleans and polishes, 
restores original finish with no oily residue, 
leaves protective shield
12/case

No Bid No Bid $58.98
Brand and Product Name: Chase #438-5153
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-17.5oz/Case

No Bid $60.75
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Water based stainless steel 
cleaner SP6310                                         
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 12-20oz can/case

No Bid $44.30
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Stainless Steel Polish 
Water Based #K01020  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-16OZ cans/case

4.10.21 Calcium, Lime & Rust Remover 
Removes calcium and lime deposits – can 
be used on a variety of surfaces, e.g., 
stainless steel, porcelain, glass, chrome, 
fiberglass, etc. – 28 oz. bottle
12 bottles/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.80
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Rustin Iron Remover  
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 12 quarts/case (3 
Gallon)

No Bid No Bid $60.18
Brand and Product Name: CLR #CLR32PRO   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6-32oz bottles/case

4.10.22 Bleach, gallon, Minimum 5% Sodium 
Hypochlorite concentration
4/ case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.85
Brand and Product Name: KIK Pure Bright Bleach 
#purebrightgl                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6-128oz Bottle/Case

4.10.23 Carpet Stain-Remover/ Cleaner – 
Quart-size spray bottle, ready-to-use, no 
dilution required, provides on-the-spot 
cleaning spot solution pre-spray
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.43
Brand and Product Name: NCL bio clean stain remover 
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  12 Quarts/case (3 
Gallons)

$27.87
Brand and Product Name: Spartan SSE Pre Spray Carpet 
Spotter SP3035                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz/case

No Bid $27.72
Brand and Product Name: Spartan SSE Carpet Pre-Spray and 
Spotter (3035)                                                      
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-32oz Bottle/case 

4.10.24 Carpet Cleaner – 
Gallon Refill, ready-to-use, no dilution 
required, provides on-the-spot cleaning 
spot solution pre-spray
4 per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.70
Brand and Product Name: NCL bio clean stain remover 
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4 Gallons/case

$31.55
Brand and Product Name: Spartan SSE Carpet Prespray & 
Spotter SP3033                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4 Gallons/case

No Bid $31.36
Brand and Product Name: Sparten SSE Carpet Pre-Spray 
#3033/4                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottle/case

4.10.25 Carpet Cleaner – 
Gallon - provides fast penetrating 
formulation that emulsifies grease, oil, soil 
– for use with extractor - Unscented
4 per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.15
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Contempo V Extraction 
Carpet Clnr SP3092                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4 gallons/case

No Bid $57.62
Brand and Product Name: Spartan CX3 Bio-Assist #1CX3BIO 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottle/case

4.10.26 Floor Wax – Gallon –Coverage – up to 
3,000 square feet per gallon, UL-approved
4/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.34
Brand and Product Name: Spartan on and on floor wax    
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 Gallons/case

$58.75
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Sunny Side Hi Gloss Floor 
Finish SP4045                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 Gallon/case

No Bid $58.43
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Sunny-Side #544504 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottle/case

4.10.27 Floor Stripper– Gallon - Powerful 
formulation that removes previous 
coatings of floor finish and wax – can be 
used with automatic scrubber
4 per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.95
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Square one stripper
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 Gallons/case   

$62.91
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Square one XHVY Duty 
Wax & Finish Stripper
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  4 gallons/case       

No Bid $53.69
Brand and Product Name: Spartan Square-One #SQUARE4  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4-128oz bottle/case

4.10.28 $26.32 (also see Alternative 1-3)                             Brand 
and Product Name: INT-2423-HVY as per sample #28-
4.10. 28A MFR IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack                     
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 1,000/case

$18.99                                                          
Brand and Product Name:Central Poly 
#CP2423.6                                                
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 
1,000/case

No Bid $21.65
Brand and Product Name: Pit Plastics                     
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 20 bags per roll - 
50 rolls/case

$26.45
Brand and Product Name: Royaliner 7GL LT Med CL 
RLHD07L/M 8 MIC                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 1000/case

$19.79 - See Alternate 1 also
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC 242406N 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 1000 Trash Can 
Liners/case

$27.91
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay #VBLH242365C 24X23 
.65 MIL Clear Liner                                           
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 500/case

4.10.28 - Alternative 1 Cost- $21.84
INT-2423-REG As per sample #28-4.10.28B MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack 
Packaging - 1,000/case

Cost: $27.25
Trash Bags/Can Liners - Roll, Clear, Low-Density, 7-10 
Gallon, 6MIL 
Brand:UPC UPC 246
Packaging: Case of 500 Trash Can Liners

4.10.28 - Alternative 2 Cost- $17.84
INT-2424-REG As per sample #28-4.10.28C MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack  
Packaging - 1,000/case

4.10.28 - Alternative 3 Cost- $13.48  
INT-2424-L As per sample #28-4.10.28D MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack 
Packaging - 1,000/case

4.10.29 $63.84 - Also see alternative 1-4
Brand and Product Name:INT-3036-SUPER Exh as 
per sample #29-4.10.29A 
MFR:IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack                               
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 500/case

$19.60
Brand and Product Name:Central Poly 
#CP3036NXH                                                
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 
100/case

No Bid $32.46
Brand and Product Name: Pit Plastics
 Packaging (size of container, # per case) 20 bags per roll - 
25 rolls/case

$36.25
Brand and Product Name: Royaliner 20GL 1.5MIL BLK Perf 
RL Liner RL20R1.5-B-PERF
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 25 bags per roll-8 
rolls/case (200 bags)

$29.35 - See alternative 1
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC 303710N
 Packaging (size of container, # per case)  500 bags/case

$27.79
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay #VBLH303615C 30X36 
1.5 MIL Clear Liner  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 150/case

Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Clear, Low-
Density, 7-10 Gallon, minimum .6 mil, 
Minimum Size 24”x23” or 24”X24”

20/carton – 50 cartons/case
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4.10.29 - Alternative 1 Cost- $51.72   
 INT-3036-Exh As per sample #29-4.10.28B MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack  
Packaging - 500/case

Trash Bags/Can Liners - Roll, Clear, High-Density, 20-30 
Gallon, 1.5MIL, 30"X36"                       
Cost: $27.25
Brand:UPC UPC 37C15  
Packaging: Case of 100 Trash Can Liners

4.10.29 - Alternative 2 Cost- $40.34     
 INT-3036-XH As per sample #29-4.10.28C MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack 
Packaging - 500/case

4.10.29 - Alternative 4 
(Alternative 3 was 
deleted by vendor)

Cost- $24.84
INT-3037-H As per sample #29-4.10.28D MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack    
Packaging - 500/case

4.10.30 $63.84 (Also see Alternative 1-2)
Brand and Product Name:INT-3036-Super Exh as per 
sample #30-4.10.30A MFR:IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 500/case

$23.70
Brand and Product Name:Central Poly 
#CP3036N2                                              
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 
100/case

No Bid $32.46
Brand and Product Name: Pit Plastics
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 25 bags per roll - 
50 rolls/case   

No Bid $40.25 - See Alternative 1
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC 303713N
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  500 bags/case

No Bid

4.10.30 - Alternative 1 Cost- $51.82
 INT-3036-Exh As per sample #29-4.10.30B MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack 
Packaging - 500/case

Trash Bags/Can Liners - Roll, Clear, High-Density, 20-30 
Gallon, 2.0 MIL, 30"X36"                       
Cost: $34.20
Brand:UPC UPC 37C2
Packaging: Case of 100 Trash Can Liners

4.10.30 - Alternative 2 Cost- $40.82
 INT-3036-XH As per sample #29-4.10.30C MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack 
  Packaging - 500/case

4.10.31 Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Black, 
Heavy Duty, 30 Gallon, minimum 1.05 mil, 
Minimum Size 30”X33”, Tie Closure
90/carton

$48.82
Brand and Product Name: INT-3033-EXH as per 
sample #31-4.10.31A MFR: 
IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack                                                
Packaging (size of container, # per case)90/case

$28.00
Brand and Product Name:Central Poly 
#CP3033KTC                                             
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 
90/case

No Bid No Bid $34.25
Brand and Product Name: Royaliner 32GL Ultra Xhvy Blk Perf 
RL Liner RL32UXH-B-Perf 1 Mil                                                     
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  250/case

$17.70
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC 33105
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 90 bags/case

$17.78
Brand and Product Name: Glad Guaranteed Strong Drawstring 
Liner 30X33 1.05 mil Black #CLO78966 
Packaging (size of container, # per case)    28 bags/box

4.10.32 Trash Bags/Can Liners - Outdoor – Roll, 
Black, Heavy Duty, 55 Gallon, minimum 3 
mil, 
Minimum Size 35”X56”, Tie Closure
120/carton

$168.72
Brand and Product Name:INT-3656-Super Tuff as per 
sample #32-4.10.32A MFR:IBS/Pitt/Glopak/Hymopack 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 120/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.00
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC 58C3
Packaging (size of container, # per case) : 120 bags/case

No Bid

4.10.33 Mop Head, Cut-End, Cotton, #16, white 
12/case

No Bid No Bid $41.88
Brand and Product Name: ABCO #CM20016 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12/Case

No Bid $18.75
Brand and Product Name: Royalab 16OZ 4P STD COT SM Cut 
End RL16COT                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6/case

No Bid $20.05
Brand and Product Name: Nextstep Envirotex cotton mophead 
cut end #97716V6PL  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 16oz mop, 6/case

4.10.34 Mop, Standard Loop, - small, 5” mesh 
band, white
12/case

No Bid No Bid See Alternative 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.80
Brand and Product Name: Nextstep Maxiclean Mophead 
#97175  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Small Mop, 12/case

4.10.34 - Alternative 1 Mop. Standard Loop - Small 5" mesh band 
**BLUE*

Cost- $43.08
ABCO #CLM303SWB
Packaging - 12/case

4.10.35 Mop, Rayon Wet, 24”, wide head, fantail
12/case

No Bid No Bid $75.48
Brand and Product Name: ABCO #LM4003LW
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 12/CASE

No Bid $31.25
Brand and Product Name: Royalab 24OZ 4P Ray Fan Head 
RL24RAYFT                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6/case

No Bid $4.11
Brand and Product Name: Tuway Wet Loop Rayon 20oz
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Sold individually

4.10.36 Broom, Angle with handle – long-lasting 
plastic fiber bristles, angle cut – head easily 
detachable for cleaning, minimum 13” 
sweep
6/case

No Bid No Bid See Alternative 1 No Bid $15.25
Brand and Product Name: Royalab BLHvy Duty Angle Broom 
Flagged RL-BL-HDANGBRM 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Sold individually

No Bid $40.35
Brand and Product Name: Nextstep Maxi Plus #91351CS
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4/case

4.10.36 - Alternative 1 Broom, Angle with handle – long-lasting 
plastic fiber bristles, angle cut – head easily 
detachable for cleaning,  12” sweep

Cost- $29.88
ABCO #BR1024MH  
Packaging - 6/case

4.10.37 Vinyl Glove, Powder Free, Non-Medical, 
Ambidextrous, Seamless, minimum 2.0 mil 
cuff thickness +/- 0.8 mil; palm thickness 
minimum 3.2 mil, +/- 0.8 mil; finger 
thickness, 3.6 mil +/- 0.8 mil; length 9.25” 
+/- 0.25” – Medium
100 per box/ 10 boxed per case

$23.40
Brand and Product Name:Med Pride-med-VPFG as 
per sample #37-4.10.37 MFR:Med Pride
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 1,000/Case

No Bid $29.90
Brand and Product Name: Safety Zone #VPF235
Packaging (size of container, # per case)   100 per box - 
10 boxes/Case

$22.48
Brand and Product Name: Inception
 Packaging (size of container, # per case)  100 per box - 10 
boxes/case

$30.65
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Vinyl Powderless Med M/P 
Glove RPVPF-Med                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 100 gloves per box - 10 
boxes/case

$38.90
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC VPF-M 
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  100 Gloves per box -
10 boxes/case

$22.79
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Glove #64V3000PFM
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 100 gloves per box - 10 
boxes/case

4.10.38 Vinyl Glove, Powder Free, Non-Medical, 
Ambidextrous, Seamless, minimum 2.0 mil 
cuff thickness +/- 0.8 mil; palm thickness 
minimum 3.2 mil, +/- 0.8 mil; finger 
thickness, 3.6 mil +/- 0.8 mil; length 9.25” 
+/- 0.25” – Large/XL
100 per box/ 10 boxed per case

$23.40
Brand and Product Name:Med Pride-Lrg/XL-VPFG as 
per sample #38-4.10.38 MRF:Med Pride    
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 1,000/Case

No Bid $29.90
Brand and Product Name: Safety Zone #VPF236 
(LARGE) or VPF238 (XL)
Packaging (size of container, # per case)   100 per box - 
10 boxes/Case

$28.87
Brand and Product Name: Inception
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  100 per box - 10 
boxes/case

$30.65
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Vinyl Powderless XLG M/P 
Glove RPVPF-XLG  
 Packaging (size of container, # per case) 100 gloves per box - 10 
boxes/case

$38.90
Brand and Product Name: UPC UPC VPF-l/XL   
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  100 Gloves per box -
10 boxes/case

$22.79
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Glove #64V3000PFL
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 100 gloves per box - 10 
boxes/case

4.10.39 Latex (Neoprene) Glove, Flock-Lined, 
Seamless, Minimum 28 mil, 12” length – 
Medium
120 pairs/case

No Bid No Bid $249.80
Brand and Product Name: Cordova #4308 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 120 Pairs/Case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.31
Brand and Product Name: Hospeco (Safety Zone) Pro Works 
Flock Lined Glove #GRFBMD1S                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 120 pair of gloves/case

Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Clear, High-
Density, 20-30 Gallon, minimum 1.5 mil, 

Minimum Size 30”X36”,
25/carton; 20 cartons per case

Trash Bags/Can Liners – Roll, Clear, High-
Density, 20-30 Gallon, minimum 2.0 mil, 

Minimum Size 30”X36”,
25/carton; 20 cartons per case
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4.10.40 Latex (Neoprene) Glove, Flock-Lined, 
Seamless, Minimum 28 mil, 12” length – 
Large/XL
120 pairs/case

No Bid No Bid $249.80
Brand and Product Name: Cordova#4309
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 120 pairs/Case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.31
Brand and Product Name: Hospeco (Safety Zone) Pro Works 
Flock Lined Glove #GRFBLG1S                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 120 pair of gloves/case

4.10.41 Jersey Knit Wrist Clute Work Gloves, 
Brown, One Size Fits Most, minimum 9-oz 
per pair 
12 pairs/pack

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.49
Brand and Product Name:Royalab BRN Jersey Glove DOZ RL-
BRNJersey-Doz                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Dozen per Package

No Bid $11.00
Brand and Product Name: Hospeco (Safety Zone) Brown Jersey 
Gloves 8-oz* #GWJBSW1                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 24 cloths per pack

4.10.42 Microfiber Cleaning Cloths, minimum 
16”X16”, general purpose cleaning, 
minimum 33 grams per cloth, can be 
extensively laundered, yellow or any color
12/pack  - 20 packs/case

No Bid No Bid $115.20
Brand and Product Name: Impact #MFC2001616 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12 per pack - 
20 packs/case

No Bid $33.50
Brand and Product Name: Royalab 16X16 microfiber Towel 
300WT 50PK Dark Gray RLMicrofiber-Gra-50PK 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 50/case

No Bid $19.75
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay 16X16 Microfiber 
Cleaning Cloth #VBWPM16Y
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 24 Cloths per pack

4.10.43 Toilet Bowl Brush, Spiral, minimum 14” 
overall length, plastic fibers, round head
12/case

No Bid No Bid $19.08
Brand and Product Name: ABCO #0017
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12/Case

No Bid $5.50
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Deluxe Scratchless Bowl 
Brush RL-Deluxebowlbrush 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Sold individually

No Bid $1.44
Brand and Product Name: Janico Bowl Brush 15.5" #4013BB
Packaging (size of container, # per case) Sold Individually

4.10.44 Toilet Paper, 2-ply, minimum sheet size 
4.25” X 3.25”, minimum 550 sheets per 
roll, soft, absorbent, 100% recycled 
content
80 rolls/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.74
Brand and Product Name: Heavenly Soft 
 Packaging (size of container, # per case) 96 rolls/case

$47.70
Brand and Product Name: RP 4X3.7 2PLY RL Tissue RPTP-2-
SEL                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 500 Sheets per Roll - 96 
Rolls/Case

No Bid No Bid

4.10.45 Paper Towels, Kitchen, Roll, 2-ply, 
minimum 8” X 11” sheet, perforated, 
minimum 70 sheets per roll, white, 100% 
recycled content
30 rolls/case

No Bid $48.00
Brand and Product Name: Marcal #06350-12
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 85 
sheets a roll/ 30 rolls per case

No Bid $32.21
Brand and Product Name: Emperor's KT230851 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 85 sheets per roll - 
30 Rolls/case

$26.47
Brand and Product Name: RP 2PLY Perf Kitchen RL Towel 85 
Sht RPKRT-Basic                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 85 Sheets per Roll - 30 
Rolls/Case

No Bid $33.25
Brand and Product Name: Essity Kitchen Paper Towel 
#HB1990A                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 84 Sheets per Roll - 30 
rolls/case

4.10.46 Multi-fold Towels, Natural, Minimum 
9.125”X9.5” 100% recycled content
250/pack  - 16 packs/case

No Bid $38.00
Brand and Product Name: Marcal #MFN-
4000                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 250 
per pack - 16 packs/case

No Bid $24.42
Brand and Product Name: Nova MK 250
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  250 per pack - 16 
packs/case

$18.75
Brand and Product Name: RP 9.25x9.5 KR Mf Towel 16/250 
UOM Only EFP RPPL RPMFK                                                     
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 250 per pack - 16 
Packs/Case (4,000 total per case)

No Bid $25.03
Brand and Product Name: Essity Paper Towel #MK520A 
 Packaging (size of container, # per case)  250 Towels per pack - 
16 packs/case

4.10.47 Roll Paper, minimum 8” X 800’, 2” core, 1-
ply, white
6 rolls/case

No Bid $39.00
Brand and Product Name: Marcal #P708B   
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 6 
rolls/case

No Bid $29.78
Brand and Product Name: Empress RT680021
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6/Case

$36.65
Brand and Product Name: RP 8X800 BL RL Towel EFP 
RPRLBL-800                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 6 rolls/case

No Bid $33.14
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Paper Towels 
#VBRT800W                                                      
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 800' per roll - 6 
rolls/case

4.10.48 Roll Paper, must minimum fit and work in 
Georgia Pacific enMotion High Capacity 
Touchless Roll Towel Dispenser 10” X 
800’, 1.75” core, Hard-wound, continuous 
sheet, white
6 rolls/case

No Bid $87.70
Brand and Product Name: Nittany #np-
680010 EWP                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6 
Rolls/Case

No Bid $68.90
Brand and Product Name: Royal Tadow 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6/case

$46.65
Brand and Product Name: RP 10X800 BL RL Towel 2"C EFT 
RPRLBL-800-10                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6 rolls/case

No Bid $76.96
Brand and Product Name: Georgia Pacific EnMotion #89460      
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  800' rolls - 6 rolls/case

4.10.49 Roll Paper, 7.78” X 800’, 1.75” core, Hard-
wound, continuous sheet, 1-ply, brown
6 rolls/case

No Bid $41.00
Brand and Product Name: Nittany #P728N
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  6 
Rolls/Case

No Bid No Bid $44.29
Brand and Product Name: GP Pac Blue 7.38X800 KR RL Towel 
EFP GP26301                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6 Rolls/case

No Bid $40.89
Brand and Product Name: Georgia Pacific Blue #26301                
Packaging (size of container, # per case)  800' rolls - 6 rolls/case

4.10.50 Vacuum Cleaner Bags for Windsor Sensor 
XP Vacuums
10 bags/pack - 25 packs per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.12
Brand and Product Name: Green Klean Vacuum Bags 
#SENSORBAG                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 10 bags/case

4.10.51 Foam Soap – Must Fit Kutol Foam 
Dispenser #9942, 1,000 ml size, Sanitizing, 
Eco-responsible pouch
1,000 ml pouch
6 per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.52 Hand Soap – Liquid Antibacterial – pH 
balanced and antibacterial hand soap
Gallon Refill
4/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.75
Brand and Product Name: 1606 Links
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 Gallons/case
Scents: No Response

$29.50
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Royal Pink Lotion Soap 
4/1GL RPPL RLROYALPINK 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 gallons/Case
Scents: Pink

No Bid No Bid

4.10.53 Hand Soap – D.G.A. plus Antimicrobial 
Foam Soap – germ killing in a luxurious, 
rich soap
1,000 ml refill – 6 pouches per case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.37
Brand and Product Name: 1611 Links 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 4 Gallons/case
Scents: No Response

No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.54 Urinal Screen - Deodorizer, VOC 
compliant, Mango Scent
12/box - 6 boxes/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.75
Brand and Product Name: Fresh Products Wave Urinal 
Screen Fresh                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 10 per box

$24.00
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Ultimate Urinal Screen 
W/Enzyme Fresh RPPL GRN RLUINAL-Fresh
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 10/case

No Bid $6.73
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Urinal Screen Cherry 
#VBUB5220B                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12 screens/case

4.10.54 - Alternativer 1 Urinal Screen - Deodorizer, VOC 
Compliant, Mango Scent - *10/Box*

Cost- $113.94
The Wave #WDSMA
Packaging - 10 per box - 6 boxers/case

4.10.55 Urinal Screen - Deodorizer, VOC 
compliant, Cotton Blossom
12/box - 6 boxes/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.75
Brand and Product Name: Fresh Products Wave Urinal 
Screen Fresh                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 10 per box

$24.00
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Ultimate Urinal Screen 
W/Enzyme Fresh RPPL GRN RLURINAL-Fresh
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 10/case

No Bid $6.73
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Urinal Screen Tutti 
Frutti #VBUB5281B                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12 screens/case



Line Item Description

RFB 31-06NOV25 - Janitorial Supplies- Term & Supply - Bid Tabulation
Central Poly-Bag Corp Pyramid School Products (Pyramid 

Paper Company)
Smith Paper Royal Papers Unipak CorpBidders: Interboro Packaging Corp Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC DBA 

Industrial Soap Company

4.10.55 - Alternative 1 Urinal Screen - Deodorizer, VOC 
compliant, *Ocean Mist, 10/box*

Cost- $113.94   
The Wave #WDSOM
Packaging - 10 per box - 6 boxers/case

4.10.56 Urinal Mat – Disposable Deodorizer Mat, 
minimum 17.5” wide X 20.5” long, black, 
grips to floor, allows for end-user to see 
when mat needs to be replaced, clean scent
6/case

No Bid No Bid $47.94
Brand and Product Name: Hospeco #1525 
 Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6/Case

$21.75
Brand and Product Name: Fresh Products Wave Urinal 
Screen Fresh                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 10 per box

$25.25
Brand and Product Name: Royalab Antimicrobial Carpet Like 
Urinal Mat BLK RLSANIMAT
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6/case

No Bid $35.10
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Urinal Mat #VBMP29B 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 6 mats/case - Unscented

4.10.57 Furniture Cleaner – 
17 oz. aerosol spray can – Deep cleans, 
polishes wood surfaces, wax-free 
protectant – fresh lemon scent
12/case

No Bid No Bid $40.98
Brand and Product Name: Chase (Spraypak) #433-
4109                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-17oz 
can/case

No Bid $47.35
Brand and Product Name: Champion 19OZ Lemon Oil 
Furniture Polish Spray CH438-5136
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 19oz cans-12 cans/case

No Bid $44.93
Brand and Product Name: Victoria Bay Lemon Furniture 
Polish #F00125                                                       
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-19oz can/case

4.10.58 Air Freshener – 
Minimum 15 oz. aerosol spray can – 
effectively deodorizes, eliminates 
unpleasant odors including smoke, fast-
acting and long-lasting formula – 
Cinnamon Scent
12/case

No Bid No Bid $39.99
Brand and Product Name: Chase #433-4113
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-15oz/Case

No Bid $43.75
Brand and Product Name: SpartanAirlift Air Freshener Fresh 
20OZ Aero SP6095
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 20oz per can - 12 
cans/case

No Bid No Bid

4.10.59 Air Freshener – 
Minimum 15 oz. aerosol spray can – 
effectively deodorizes, eliminates 
unpleasant odors including smoke, fast-
acting and long-lasting formula – Fresh 
Linen/Cotton Scent
12/case

No Bid No Bid $39.99
Brand and Product Name: Chase #433-4113
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-15oz/Case

No Bid $43.75
Brand and Product Name: SpartanAirlift Air Freshener Fresh 
20OZ Aero SP6095
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 20oz per can - 12 
cans/case

No Bid No Bid

4.10.60 Air Freshener – 
Minimum 15 oz. aerosol spray can – 
effectively deodorizes, eliminates 
unpleasant odors including smoke, fast-
acting and long-lasting formula – Floral 
Scent
12/case

No Bid No Bid $39.99
Brand and Product Name: Chase #433-4113
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-15oz/Case

No Bid $43.75
Brand and Product Name: SpartanAirlift Air Freshener Fresh 
20OZ Aero SP6095  
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 20oz per can - 12 
cans/case

No Bid No Bid

4.10.61 Air Freshener – 
Minimum 15 oz. aerosol spray can – 
effectively deodorizes, eliminates 
unpleasant odors including smoke, fast-
acting and long-lasting formula – Lemon 
Scent
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.75
Brand and Product Name: SpartanAirlift Air Freshener Fresh 
20OZ Aero SP6095 
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 20oz per can - 12 
cans/case

No Bid No Bid

4.10.62 Air Freshener – 
Minimum 15 oz. aerosol spray can – 
effectively deodorizes, eliminates 
unpleasant odors including smoke, fast-
acting and long-lasting formula – various 
scents
12/case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.63 Air Freshener – 
Metered – minimum 5.3 oz. aerosol spray, 
must fit standard-size metered aerosol 
dispenser, effectively deodorizes, 
eliminates unpleasant odors including 
smoke, fast-acting and long-lasting formula 
– various scents
12 per case

No Bid No Bid $41.98
Brand and Product Name:Hospeco #079xx Series   
Packaging (size of container, # per case)12-5.3 oz/case
Scents: Please visit WWW.Hospeco.com to view 
available scents

No Bid $45.95
Brand and Product Name: Royal 9000 Lavender Breeze Aero 
Air Freshner RPPL RL-LB9000 
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 4/case
Scents Lavender, Linen, Orchard Groves

No Bid No Bid

4.10.64 Disinfectant Spray Bottle – 16.5 oz. aerosol 
spray can – quaternary spray disinfectant, 
formulated to kill cold and flu viruses
12 per case

No Bid No Bid $38.99
Brand and Product Name: Chase #433-4104
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 12-16.5oz/case
Scents: N/A

$58.63
Brand and Product Name: Spray pack spray, disinfectant 
Packaging (size of container, # per case): 12-20oz cans/case
Scents No response

$47.85
Brand and Product Name: Champion 17oz Disinfect Spray 
Citrus Aero CH438-5157   
Packaging (size of container, # per case) 17 oz per can- 12 
cans/case
Scents 17 oz can - 12 cans/case

No Bid No Bid

4.10.65 Firm, Fixed Discount off the current 
contractor catalog price or MSRP, 
whichever is less, for other janitorial 
supply items not specifically identified in 
the previous line items.

50% 0% 10% 10% Will receive deviated/reduced pricing  Do not have pricing set 
up for entire product catalog.

21% 30%

4.10.66.1 1st Renewal Option Percentage Price 
Adjustment 

0% 8% 20% 4% 7% 5% 5%

4.10.66.2 2nd Renewal Option Percentage Price 
Adjustment

5% 8% 20% 5% 5% 5% 5%

4.10.66.3 3rd Renewal Option Percentage Price 
Adjustment

5% 8% 20% 6% 5% 5% 5%

Notes: Delivery time: 5-7 days Delivery time: 30 days $50.00 Min. Order stated full cases must be bought. 
Delivery time: 10-14 Days

Delivery time: 1-15 Days Delivery time: 15 Days (Deliveries happen on Monday) 
Electronic ordering only



Line Item Description

RFB 31-06NOV25 - Janitorial Supplies- Term & Supply - Bid Tabulation
Central Poly-Bag Corp Pyramid School Products (Pyramid 

Paper Company)
Smith Paper Royal Papers Unipak CorpBidders: Interboro Packaging Corp Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC DBA 

Industrial Soap Company

Co-Op Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes


